GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

INVITATION TO BID

Paving Materials - Siﬁns

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.

BID SHEET

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein.
All prices SHALL include freight.

TRAFFIC SIGNS
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
12X18 WHITE ON BLUE £, 95 R®./i0
12X36 BLACK ON YELLOW 12.20 IS, 50
18X18 BLACK ON YELLOW 9, Lo TAEY >
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW 12 .95 IS. 258
18X24 RED ON WHITE 12,95 Is.25
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE 12.95 is.25
18X24 GREEN ON WHITE 12, 95 /5. 25
18X6 WHITE ON RED 5. 00 B .00
30" CIR BLACK ON YELLOW 26.75 3/.55
30" TRI RED ON WHITE {3 .80 /5. 90
24X30 BLACK ON WHITE 20.95 24,80
24X8 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN DG — g, 20
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 26¢./ 5 30,95
30X30 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN DIAMOND = s 32.72.
30X30 RED ON WHITE 2615 30.95
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW 24 .15 24,95
30X36 BLACK ON WHITE 2, O 27:. 460
36X18 BLACK ON YELLOW 19, 20 22,465
60X30 BLACK ON WHITE s, 90 JARE <
6X30 BLACK ON WHITE — —
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 2645 230,95
24X12 BLACK ON ORANGE 9.00 0. 55
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 26.15 30.95
36X18 BLACK ON ORANGE 19, 20 22,45
30X24 BLACK ON ORANGE 20.9%< 24, %0
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 24,15 40,95
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE FACE ONLY U, qz 1200
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY .92 12.60
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE FACE ONLY g . «n Y. LS
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY q.%0 (H ts
30X30 RED ON WHITE FACE ONLY g,30 Y, (.S
STREET SIGNS FACE ONLY
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
18x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED - <, 30
24x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED = -2.10
30x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED @.20
36x9 GHREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED — 2.65
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 Ne Bid Ne & d
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 \
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS l
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS \
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 |
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 ‘
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 \
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS ‘
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS l ]
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
MISC. SIGNS
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GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Si%ns

SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs 2,35
SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9"
Signs (.00
12 GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# 1575
10 GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2i# 1{.9¢
8' GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# Q.10
8' SQUARE POST 1 34" X1 %" —
10 SQUARE POST 1% X1 %" 52,17
12’ SQUARE POST 1 34" X1 %" —
3 ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2" —
6" WHITE SERIES B UPPERCASE Ne 8 d
6" WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE 1
3" WHITE SERIES B UPPERCASE
3" WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE
2" WHITE 2" SERIES C LETTERS
4" WHITE 4" SERIES C LETTERS
6" BLACK 6" SERIES C LETTERS
2" BLACK 2" NUMBERS SERIES C i
4" BLACK 4" NUMBERS SERIES C
6" BLACK 6" NUMBERS SERIES C
10'8" PLASTIC 120 4 % %1 BARRICADE PLANKS L€ L0 Y, 170
2> PLASTIC BARRICADE A FRAMES W
28 NO COLLARS CONES 510
28" WITH COLLARS CONES ]
1P/ D& 24 plas He STOP SLOW PADDLE 29,90
£E~35 34 TRI-POD STANDS 53,20

Prices for both:

Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity
Specs See:

Department Of Transportation State of
Georgia Standard Specifications for
Construction of Roads and Bridges
Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1
Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec

# Attached
Name of Bidder: )
DDU?}\I&.S ﬂ"lr-(alf DATE szb/fé
Company:
Pro‘#(c {'l'on Services Inc
Lead Time:

30 Jayg




GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Paving Materials - Siﬁns

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.

BID SHEET
The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein.
All prices below shall NOT include freight.

See page >
TRAFFIC SIGNS
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
12X18 WHITE ON BLUE
12X36 BLACK ON YELLOW
18X18 BLACK ON YELLOW
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW
18X24 RED ON WHITE
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE
18X24 GREEN ON WHITE
18X6 WHITE ON RED
30" CIR BLACK ON YELLOW
30" TRI RED ON WHITE
24X30 BLACK ON WHITE
24X8 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE
30X30 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN DIAMOND
30X30 RED ON WHITE
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW
30X36 BLACK ON WHITE
36X18 BLACK ON YELLOW
60X30 BLACK ON WHITE
6X30 BLACK ON WHITE
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE
24X12 BLACK ON ORANGE
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE
36X18 BLACK ON ORANGE
30X24 BLACK ON ORANGE
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE FACE ONLY
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE FACE ONLY
30X30 BLACKON YELLOW FACE ONLY
30X30 RED ON WHITE FACE ONLY
STREET SIGNS FACE ONLY
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
18x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED
24x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED
30x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED
36x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 .
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
MISC. SIGNS
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
5
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GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Signs

Se¢ page L‘P

GRADE INTENSITY

SIGN BRACKET For 9” Signs
SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9”
Signs

12' GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2#

10’ GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2#

8' GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2#

8' SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %"

10’ SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %"

12' SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %"

3' ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2"

6" WHITE SERIES B UPPERCASE

6" WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE

3" WHITE SERIES B UPPERCASE

3: WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE

2" WHITE 2" SERIES C LETTERS

4" WHITE 4" SERIES C LETTERS

6" BLACK 6" SERIES C LETTERS

2" BLACK 2" NUMBERS SERIES C

4" BLACK 4" NUMBERS SERIES C

6" BLACK 6" NUMBERS SERIES C

10'8 " PLASTIC BARRICADE PLANKS

42" PLASTIC BARRICADE A FRAMES

28" NO COLLARS CONES

28" WITH COLLARS CONES
STOP SLOW PADDLE
TRI-POD STANDS
Prices for both:
Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity
Specs See:
Department Of Transportation State of
Georgia Standard Specifications for
Construction of Roads and Bridges
Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1
Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec

. Attached
Name of Bidder: :
Dovglas Mice ] DATE 2/=2¢//¢
Company:

Pr-o 1Lec ‘l’fan Services Inc

Lead Time:

30 c\o\\/s




GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Siﬁns

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.

BID SHEET
The under. d bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein.
All prices(SHALL include freight.
“—1"TRAFFIC SIGNS
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION RADE INTENSITY
12X18 WHITE ON BLUE I (% iZ 1V i =
12X36 BLACK ON YELLOW L P ilL.Od
18X18 BLACK ON YELLOW A.62.
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW 1.0
18X24 RED ON WHITE 1l oS
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE 1L oY
18X24 GREEN ON WHITE [T
18X6 WHITE ON RED Z
30" CIR BLACK ON YELLOW | 23 05
30" TRI RED ON WHITE | \\. 5B
24X30 BLACK ON WHITE 1540
24X8 ' FLORESCENT YELLOW GREETD Q.
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE - 273 073
30X30 LORESCENT YELLOW GREEN J | DIAMOND | ‘-1-’.’;8%_
30X30 RED ON'WHITE ALy
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW 27 ()Y
30X36 1 BLACK ON WHITE 3
36X18 BLACK ON YELLOW [ =
60X30 BLACK ON WHITE Ho 1O
6X30 BLACK ON WHITE 5D
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE O3
24X12 BLACK ON ORANGE -
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE TN
36X18 BLACK ON ORANGE )
30X24 BLACK ON ORANGE [ Te)
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE a>.07h
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE FACE ONLY | mnin 1O %3
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY [+ n L0 W)
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE FACEONLY | ywmin \D ons
30X30 BLACK ON_YELLOW FACEONLY | mnin \Q )
30X30 RED ON WHITE FACE ONLY | A iV 1
STREET SIGNS FACEONLY § mun 1©
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION ADE INTENSITY
18x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED Q
24x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED 0,
30x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED 3,
36x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED = 3R
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS =
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 N OP)I D
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 L /
MISC. SIGNS \JI \I

Custom Products Comoration



GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Siﬁns

SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
| SIZE =~ | COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE | INTENSITY |

SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs 219 _Fv 55" 10,50 For | "
SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9" B ‘
Signs 2,19 _Risst |loso forip !

12 GREEN T U CHANNEL POST 2# w1 10O 3 Yo

10 GREEN \ U CHANNEL POST 2% _pin 100 4 5

g GREEN Y U CHANNEL POST 2# _run 1O Lo

g SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %" 18523

10" SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %"

i SQUARE POST 19" X1 %" ua

3 ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2" ]8,1

6" WHITE SERIES B UPPERCASE wviv 15 S

6" WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE % A S0

3 WHITE SERIES B UPPERCASE Ual

3 WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE o NoBD

2" WHITE 2" SERIES C LETTERS ~ A2

g WHITE 4" SERIES C LETTERS

6" BLACK= 6" SERIES C LETTERS ; .

2 BLACK=~ 2" NUMBERS SERIES C 1 9.

4" BLACK 4" NUMBERS SERIES C NG

6" BLACK 6" NUMBERS SERIES C S Es)

108" PLASTIC Mia. 0 BARRICADE PLANKS _B/F [T 4490

42 PLASTIC maia, W0 1ens BARRICADE A FRAMES [+ X-4C =

28" NO COLLARS J CONES min . 009 ¢ & s Xd | pwm [ S5 [0.95

28" WITH COLLARS\ CONES paun IO 7 e ] ‘; =

1}M w723 % STOP SLOW PADDLE A

TRI-POD STANDS

Prices for both:
Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity
Specs See:

Department Of Transportation State of
Georgia Standard Specifications for
Construction of Roads and Bridges
Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1
Fiberglass Relnforced Plastic - Spec
* Attached

N\Xéi N R

Company:

pate (D5 25:[(p

Custom Products Comporation
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GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Paving Materials - Si

S

List all deviations to the bid specifications on this page.

—— -

'Equal or Gréater than these specs

SCOPE

This eaacificrlion covérs ganeral laminate properties, machanics| properties, physical properties, and applicable documents
for \ sk ) Flberatags Reinforead Plastics (FRP) trafflc conlrel sign panels, Theses pansls shall be avallable in .048,
080, ,090,, 098, and 135, Panel thickness of .05 and 135 are avaitable In white, yallow, gmeen, red, blue, black, brown

and lvory.
PHYSICAL PROPERTIES

THIGKNESS - Panels shall be 045 .G80, .050, 085 or
"133 [acheg thiak with & toleranca of +/-.005 Inches,

BLASS CONTENT » Tha panel ghall kave a minimum
21% glazs content, The slgh panal glass shall be read
uaing o A0 Glossmetar and have the followlng valuas;
Servies Side - 53% Reflaclive,

Wackeide « 85% Reflective

SIZE - (lsnpth mnd width) Pane! tolarancs on nominsl
lenglh and width apecifiad by (he purchnser shall be +/-
1/8 inch far dimensions of 12 feet or less when measured
Iy accurdanay with ASTM DAG41-00,

SQUARENESS - Panels shall be monhufectured with |,
smoath Aurfaces on both the top and bottom of fhe panai,
within 1/8 Inch of squarenass per 12 feet of length when
meautred In accordance with ASTM D3841-80,

gg;_.%_&igj,_q%- Parisl shall be plgmanted o &
vigually untorm color. Color shall be visuslly uniform with
tha plgments compoundad into the resins befare curs (o

make the calor ant [nlegral part of the laminate. The white
sign panel eolor must maest the following Trshimulus
Values s measured on the FMC-2 colorsorle ona
lgl;gl;oth 1500 Spectrophotomater; X-72.29, Y-73.80, 2-

COEPRIE R

COEFRICIBNT OF LINEAR THERMAL EXPANSION -
Pansla ahall have n mmdmum cosfMclent of Inear thermal '

axpanion of 1.8 X 10° incivinh/ F whon teasted in

accardance with ASTM DES6-79,

I CE - Panels shall be ¢lassified
minimally as Grade Il (weather reslstant) panel as
spacified in ASTM D3841-80 Tollawing 2 3,000 100 haur
wealheromotar test.

BLATNESS - Panels ghal hava & maximum defaction of
0.5 [nches when tested in accordance with TSP
(Appandlx Il).

%ﬁﬁlﬁg - ::3?'. nh;ll rsill! the mpact of
a1.18 b, g ball, drop rom 60 fast In accord
whth ASTM D3641-60, e

Wa_&m - Panel strangth and Impact
raslstance shal| nel be ap‘Pmulahiv affected ovar a

temperalure mange of-65 F (o 212 1,

GENERAL LAMINATE PROPERTIES
" trafflc control wign punel shall have the
wame smaolh surfaces on both sldes with a mialum of
-004 protective layer of gel eoating, The panel shall be
{:ndnmlyloﬂ:lwd.id' pped fibarglass relnf 1,
armaasl, pigmentad polysster laminate. The panel
ahall be serylls modifiad and Uy stabllized for outdoor
weatharability, It shall eantaln additives to retard flamg
propagaton but shali contalh no other fillars.

The panal must not have any visible fbemglass
prominence. The panel must be atablllzed throughout
with the glass and n nonsshrink resin, which retards
malsture aboorption o lass than 001 per square inch,

The' panel shall b stabillzed lo proven
releasée of migrafing constituents aver tme. (e, rolvents,
monomers, etc.) and shall contaln no residual release
ugants on tha surfuce of the laminate that will Interfere
any subsequent bondlng operetions,

Tha panel shall not contain vielble cracks,
pinholes, forelgn i i of surface wrinkles that
would affect Implled parformanee, alter the specific
dimenslons of the panel, or othirwlae affect its
serviceablity.

MECHANICAL PROPERTIES

All mechanleal propertin nre alated as typlcal avéregea
ond many vary +/- 10% on any Individual test average.
The averayes raﬁruun‘. properiies measured both in lhe
linm diraction of the panal and at 90 degraes to that fing,
The mechanical properies are testad In accardance with
Ihe approprizie ASTM tests referanced,

PVDJULTa

Liskd sn PO ©. VIO YBOTY

thicknesy

ASTM Tant
D-£54
[ Flexural Modulus -
Gomprasgalon Strength D-895
Co v Modulus R D-g95
Punch %ﬁ Eﬁ]ﬁ 12,000 pe D-732
Face jmpacl Reslslance A lbs per mil of | D-3028

APPLICABLE DOCUMENTS

DP=3841 Glosy Fiber Relnforsed Polyaster Panals,
Spacifications for
D638 Tensile Properties of Plastics, Test for
D-780  Flexutal Propurties of Plastle and Electrical
Insulating Materials, Test for

Gompressive Praperiles of Rigld Plastics, Test

ot
ED_-?_Q: Shear Strangth of Plastles for Punch Tool, Test
ar

D-698  Cosfficlent of Linsar Thermal

Plasiies, Test for il

Ban2g 1m§c‘. Resistance of Flat, Rigld Plastic
Spvelmens by means of Tup (Falling Walght), Tent for

%ég - 3‘ FRP Traffic Sign Panel Flatness Test {por

sppandlx A)
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INVITATION TO BID

aving Materials - Signs
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GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs GA Cos reu}“l ow =l

*

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.

BID SHEET
The und??gaaﬁ bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein.
All priced SHALL/include freight.
“—_J"TRAFFIC SIGNS
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
| SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE | INTENSITY |
12X18 WHITE ON BLUE MO VS
12X36 BLACK ON YELLOW |
18X18 BLACK ON YELLOW f
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW 1
18X24 RED ON WHITE |
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE i {
18X24 GREEN ON WHITE | 10
18X6 WHITE ON RED ;
30" CIR BLACK ON YELLOW
30" TRI RED ON WHITE ]
24X30 BLACK ON WHITE |
24X8 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN |
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE I
30X30 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN DIAMOND
30X30 RED ON WHITE
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW J/ . K&
30X36 BLACK ON WHITE : g
36X18 BLACK ON YELLOW
60X30 BLACK ON WHITE
6X30 BLACK ON WHITE
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE |
24X12 BLACK ON ORANGE 2:0¢
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE LYY 7.
36X18 BLACK ON ORANGE y
30X24 BLACK ON ORANGE 1 7-3¢
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 2 g
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE FACE ONLY Vol
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW FAGE ONLY o (A
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE FACE ONLY 4,8
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY G ile®
30X30 RED ON WHITE FACE ONLY P
STREET SIGNS FACE ONLY .
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE | COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
18x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED =T 7. 79
24x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED (D3
30x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED |
36x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 | ]
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS | ]
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 ! |
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS i
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .00 ¥ |,
MISC. SIGNS




GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Siﬁns
S famdor

SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE | INTENSITY |
SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs o . F
SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9"

Sligns
12 GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# _
10’ GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# 79 .
8 GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2#
g SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 3%~ I 00
10’ SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %" 11e . 5
12’ SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 W
3 ANCHOR 3’ X 2" X 2" 3
6" WHITE SERIES B UPPERCASE [0 .50 7k
8" WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE 10 .30/ Pk
3 WHITE SERIES B UPPERCASE e 50 7 Ok
3" WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE 4 O d 21
2" WHITE 2" SERIES C LETTERS . 2571 2k
4" WHITE 4" SERIES C LETTERS 7 A51 Pl
6" BLACK 6" SERIES C LETTERS
2" BLACK 2" NUMBERS SERIES C
4" BLACK 4" NUMBERS SERIES C
6" BLACK 6" NUMBERS SERIES C
10'8* PLASTIC BARRICADE PLANKS D A
42" PLASTIC BARRICADE A FRAMES
28" NO COLLARS CONES
28" WITH COLLARS CONES

STOP SLOW PADDLE TR

TRI-POD STANDS 30 | (D

Prices for both: A\
Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity N
Specs See:
Department Of Transportation State of
Georgia Standard Specifications for
Construction of Roads and Bridges
Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1
Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec
: Attached

v cr f
P>)

S G Sweel
/
Zpa YL P Sheehds 7
Name of Bidder:
?__\ A LL’L\)(’*L\ X DATE ] -4 Y
Company: .1
Lead Time:




GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Siﬁ_ns

List all deviations to the bid specifications on this page.

- Tlews
<—)>€c'i(;'u' will
S.E ., St

- Al €i§WS il

(A Covve chieua

bid whert /"guf)er éwsa'vw{r‘ Grade i
be pmduczd with 7M’
Jard gms‘m((r ér(‘cjt’ S"/\-((”IV\\S :

be  &luwmumn - mit lbevsless

- Al g Immg‘.L} wil be 7M* HIP.

Eqﬁal or Greater than these specs

SCOPE -
This anecification covers g I |
or \ sivsi » Fiber

rties, and »p

rtles, physical prop

prop . Mechenics! prop plicabl b
Reinforced Plastica (FRP) treflic conirol sign penels. These panels shal be availuble in 045,

080, 000, 098, and 138 Pannl thickness of 085 and .135 sre avalably In white, yeiiow, green, red, blue, biack, brown

and vory.
PHYSICAL PROPERTIES

- Penele shall be .045 .080, .090, .095 or
.133 inches thick with a tolarance of +/-,006 inches.

GLASS CONTENT - Tha panel chall heve a minimum
21% glaas contenl. The sign panal glass shall b read
using r 80 Gloasmatar and have the follawing values:
Bervicw Side - 62% Raflactive,

Backuide - 85% Reflective

SIZE - (length and width) Pane! lolerance on neminal
length and width spacified by the purchasel shall be +/-

The panel must not have any visible fibeiglsss
prominance. The panel must be stablilzad throughout
with the glass and & non-shrink resin, which iwtaids
molsture sbsorption to lass than .001 per squars Inch

Tha

panel shall be stablized to preven

releasy of migrating cansiituents over Urrﬁ. (i:-. M.

monomars, ¢ic.) and chall

agents on ihe surfsce of the laminats thet will intarfere
any subsequent bonding operations.

ihe

panel zhall nol cantain vieible cracks,
Ihckiaions. or surt tnkles that

1/8 inah for dimensions of 12 feet of leas when
in acoordance with ASTM D3841-80.

SQUARENGSS - Pansis shall be menufsciured with _
smooth surfaces on both the tap and boltom of the panei,
within 178 inch of squareness per 12 fest of longth when
measured In scoordance with ABTM D3841-60.

- Panal shall be pipmented to o
uniform color, Color shall be visuslly uniform with
the pigments compaunded into the rasina betora cure to
maky the color an integral part of the laminate. The white
sign pancl color must meel the fnllewing Trishimudus
Valugs ss measured on the FMC-2 oolor acale on a
MacBeth 1500 Spectrophoiomeler; X-72.29, Y-73,60, 2-

COEPRICIENY OF LINEAR THERMAL EXPANSION -
Panaly shall have & mpdmum couflicient ef lnesr therma!
axpanalen of 1.8 x 10° inchAineh/ F whon tested in
accordance with ASTM D886-79,

mm%ﬁm » Paneis shall ba classified
minimalty as (weather reslslant) panel as
apacifiod In ASTM DAA41-A0 lollowing 2 3,000 +100 hour
wiatheromoter fest,

- Panols shal have a maximum deflection of
0.5 Inches when tested in accordance with TSP.{
(Appandix II),

WEAﬂ_ﬁm - Pansla shall resist the Impact of
.18 1. falling ball, dropped from 60 feet In sccordance
whth ASTM D3841-80.

%BMLBIAMHI’L- Panel strangth and impact
tance shall not be apprecisbly affoctod over w

empersiute range of85 F o 212 F
GENERAL LAMINATE PROPERTIES

tmffia control v paned shall hava e
sane smooth surfaces on sldes with @ minimum of
004 p loyer of gel ing. The panel ehall be
randomly wisnted, chopped fiberglags n!I?EMd'
> a!, plgmantad polyesier lami @ panel
ahall be mcrylic modifiay and UV stabllized for ouldoor
weatherabilily, It shall contnin additives 1o retard flame
pr gation bul shall no olhar fillars,

would affect Implied
dimenvaions
senviceabity.

porformance, alter the specific
of the panel, or otherwize affect its

MECHANICAL PROPERTIES

NI mechanical properties are slaled os lypicol averagos
und many vary +/ 10% on any individual test avarnge
The avemges represon| proparties massured both in the
linm diréction of Ihe panel and st B0 degmes 1o ludt line,
Tha mechanieal propertios are tested in accurdance with

the appropriate ASTM tests

referenced,

| A Min Raq | ASTM Test
Tesnall engt 14, pul D838 —
anaile Modull i D538
sl Sireng 5 =
Flxural Modulus it
Compression Stre 30,000 psl T
Ive i _jbges
r . 732
Face Impact Resistance | 1.1 Ibo por mil of )
— thickness
APPLICABLE DOCUMENTS

ASTM STANDARDS
3841 Glam Fiber Reinforced Poiyester Panais,
Spacifiaations for

Tensile Proparties of Plastics, Test for
D-780  Flexural Propmties of Plastie and Elecirica!
Insulsfing Materlals, Test for

Compressive Properties of Rigid Plustics, Test
or
%Z!Z Shesr Strength of Plastics for Punch Tool, Test

Cosfficient of Linser Thermal Expansion of

pgpe
Plastics, Test for

£:3Q28 'mpact Reslsiance of Flat, Rigid Plastc
Spocimans by means of Tup (Faisng Weigh?), Test for

IEP-1 FRP irﬂc Sign Panel Flatnazs Teet (per
ppandix A)



GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Yulcand S:e9n S

Paving Materials - Si%ns

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.

BID SHEET

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein.
All prices SHALL include freight.

TRAFFIC SIGNS

SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
12X18 WHITE ON BLUE NO BID $ 5.05
12X36 BLACK ON YELLOW NO BID 9.87
18X18 BLACK ON YELLOW NO BID 7.40
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW NO BID 9.87
18X24 RED ON WHITE NO BID 9.87
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE NO BID 5.87
18X24 GREEN ON WHITE NO BID 5.87
18X6 WHITE ON RED NO BID 2.69
30" CIR BLACK ON YELLOW NO BID 20.79
30" TRI RED ON WHITE NO BID 10.40
24X30 BLACK ON WHITE NO BID 16.45
24X8 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN 3M #3980 FYG NO BID 6.35
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE NO BID 20.56
30%30 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN DIAMOND 3M #3980 FYG NO BID 29.39
30X30 RED ON WHITE NO BID 20.56
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW NO BID 20.56
30X36 BLACK ON WHITE NO BID 24.68
36X18 BLACK ON YELLOW NO BID 14.81
60X30 BLACK ON WHITE NO BID 41,13
6X30 BLACK ON WHITE NO BID 4.23
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE NO BID 20.56
24X12 BLACK ON ORANGE NO BID 6.55
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE NO BID 20.56
36X18 BLACK ON ORANGE NO BID 14.81
30X24 BLACK ON ORANGE NO BID 16.45
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE NO BID 20.56
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE FACE ONLY NO BID 4.26
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY NO BID 4.26
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE FACE ONLY NO BID g8.88
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY NO BID 8,88
30X30 RED ON WHITE FACE ONLY NO BID 8.88

STREET SIGNS FACE ONLY NO BID =T
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
18x9 GREEN DOUBLE SIDED BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED NO BID 6.84
24x9 GREEN DOUBLE SIDED BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED NO BID 9.45
30x9 GREEN DOUBLE SIDED BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED NO BID 11.38
36x9 GREEN DOUBLE SIDED BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED NO BID 13.83
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 NO BID NOFCLD
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 NO BID NO BID
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 NO BID ey
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 NO BID NO BID
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 NO BID NO BID
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 NO BID NO BID
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 NO BID NO BID
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 NO BID NO BID
MISC. SIGN




GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Si%ns

Prices for both:

SUPERENGHIYEER HIGH

SIZLE COLOR DESCRIPTION BEARE INTENSITY

SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs  V5-1 5 3.35

SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9"

Signs VsS-1 3.35
12’ GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2i# 15.91
10 GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2i# 13.26
8' GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# 10.61
8 SQUARE POST 1 32" X1 %" 14 GA 14.14
10’ SQUARE POST 1 %2” X1 %" 14 GA 17.13
12' SQUARE POST 1 34" X1 %" 14 GA 20.54
3' ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2" 12 GA 7.78
6" WHITE 25 PER PACK SERIES B UPPERCASE $10.35/PKG
6" WHITE 25 PER PACK SERIES B LOWERCASE 10.35/PKG
3" WHITE 25 PER PACK SERIES B UPPERCASE 4.20/PKG
3" WHITE 25 PER PACK SERIES B LOWERCASE 4.20/PKG
2" WHITE 25 PER PACK 2" SERIES C LETTERS 3.25/PKG
4" WHITE 25 PER PACK 4" SERIES C LETTERS 6.95/PKG
6" BLACK 25 DPER PACK 6" SERIES C LETTERS 5.85/PKG
2" BLACK 25 PER PACK 2" NUMBERS SERIES C 2.65/PKG
4" BLACK 25 PER PACK 4" NUMBERS SERIES C 3.65/PKG
6" BLACK 25 PER PACK 6" NUMBERS SERIES C 5.85/PKG
10'8 " PLASTIC BARRICADE PLANKS MINIMUM QTY 20 59.04
42" PLASTIC BARRICADE A FRAMESMINIMUM QTY 20 20.04
28" NO COLLARS CONES 9.66
28" WITH COLLARS CONES 14.41

18" | STOP SLOW PADDLE WITH 72" HANDLK 18.69
TRI-POD STANDS V-11 32.85

Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity

Specs See:

Department Of Transportation State of
Georgia Standard Specifications for

Construction of Roads and Bridges

Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1

Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec
Attached

Naﬁé of l%lc,lﬁ/%/ rgs;‘ﬁ_

- .DATE 02/25/2016

DAV

Company:

VULCAN SIGHNS

. BEVIACQUA, SALES

GER

Lead Time:

30 DAYS ARO




GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Siﬁns l/d lean] 6:7 M5

List all deviations to the bid specifications on this page.

SIGN PRICES ARE BASED ON STANDARD MUTCD SIGNS. 3M 3930 HIP ON .080 GAUGE ALUMINUM.

8'-1 3/4" SQ POSTS - MUST BE ORDERED IN BUNDLES OF 25,

BARRICADE PLANKS -

420

PRICE BASED ON HIP SHEETING ON BOTH SIDES. MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY 20.
BARRICADE A-FRAMES - PRICE BASED ON SINGLE LEG. MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY 20.

Equal or Gréater than these specs

SCOPE

This soedficatlon cavers general laminata proparties, machanicsl prépedies, physical properties, and applicable documents

fory siea, .

t Fiberglass Reinforoed Plastics (FRP} traflic conlrol sign panels, Thess panels shall be avsilable in .045,

080, ,050,, 088, and 135, Panel thickness of .05 and ,135 are available In white, yeliow, gtsen, red, hiue, blaock, brown

and fvory.
PHYSICAL PROPERTIES

THICKNESS - Panels shall be 045 040, 090, 095 or
1135 Inches thick with a talerance of +/-,008 Inches,

GLASS CONTENT - The panel shall have a minimum
21% gisss conlant, The slgh punal glase shall bo resd
uelng n 60 Glasamealer ond have the following valuas:
Service Side - 53% Relective,

WBackeide - 85% Reflactive

SIZE - (ngth ang width) Pane! iolerance on nominal
length and width spacified by the purchaser shaolf ba +~
18 inch fiar dimensions of 12 feet or lesa when measured
In accordancy with ASTM D3841.80.

The panel must not have any visible fbeiyglass
praminence, The panel must ba stablitzed throughout
with tha glass and B nen-shrink resin, which retards
molsture absarpian lo less than 001 per square inch.

The’ panel shall be stablilxed te prevent
releasa of migrating bonslitants aver tme, (e, Ralvente,
manomera, sic.) and shall contaln no resaldiral release
sgants on the surface of the laminate that will interfere
any subsecuent bonding operations.

The panel shall not contain visible cracks,
pinhales, forelgn Inclusians, or surfacs wiinkles that
would affect Imphed performance, aller the epagific
dimenslons of the panel, or utherwise alfest its

SQUARENESS - Fanels shall be monutaciurad with | serviceability.
smoath surfncas on balh the top and battern of the panai,
wilthin 1/8 Inch of squarenass per 12 feet of longth When MECHANICAL PROQPERTIES

mgantred In accordance with ASTM D3841-80,

COLOR & GLOSS - Pane| shell be plpmanted to n
vigually untform color. Culor shall be visuslly uniform with
tha plgments compounded into the rasins belare clire to
mako the oolor Bn Integral part of the lemirate, The whits
sign panel color must maet the following Triahimulus
Valuss as mensured on the FMG-2 oolor scale on a

Al mechanical propertine ane slated as typical overapes
and many vary +~ 10% on any Individusl test avernge.
The 9 praven! preparics m. ed both In the
Bna dirgetion of Ihe panaf and st 90 degress lo hat line,
The mechanieal properties are tested in ascurdance with
The appropriate ASTH tosts referanced,

g!acﬂuth 1500 Gpeclrophotometer; X-72,29, Y-73,80, 2- ) nicsl Prope Avp Min. Req. ASTM Teal
: e 5t t 14,500 pai | D533
i 000 1 O B3

COEPRICH LINEA MAL EXPANSION - -—-FEI:‘: I s,
Pandly shall hava n meximum cosfiicinnt of lear thermal poum Siendih 125000 0s] 7 T
expansicn of 1.8 x 107 Inchingh! F whan toated In E'gﬁ"&'_mux 1,400,000 pel 750

acrardance with ASTM DESE-79, mpression Strength 30,000 psl D-855 -

MJM_&&MF{!EE « Pansls shall b cidssifed
minimally as Grade [ (weather reslstant) :me' a3

Damprossive Moduliis 400,000 osi [ G686
Punoh Shear Strenath 2.000 pei D-732

Face linpact Reslstance | 1.1 ibs per mil of | D-3045

specified in ASTM DAARY1-B0 lollowing 3 3,000 <100 haur Ihicknass

waathefomoler tas), .
APPLICABLE DOCUMENTS

ELATHESS - Pansts shull have a maximin deflaction of STANOARDS

0.5 Inclies when tested in secordanss with TSP D-2841 Glass Fiber Relnforced Polyester Panels,

(Appanatx I, . Spaciiications for

IMPACT RESISTANCE . Panals shall resiat tha limpset of
a 1.18 Ib. faliing ball, dropped from B0 fagt |n occordance
with ASTM D3841-80,

I S = Panel atrength and Impact
resislance shall not be appraglobly affected over a
1amperalure rmnge of-65 I‘?w 212F,

GENERAL LAMINATE PROPERTIES
mafflc conrol sign pansl ahall hava the

same m\au!h surfaces on both aldes with & minlmum of
.on4 proluctive layer of gel doating, The panei shall be
randomly oriantod, choppad fibarglass re nforcd,
thétmasat, plymented polyester laminate. The panel
hall be seryllo modifiad and UV stabilized for outdoer
wastherubility, |t shall contain additives to retard flamg
propagation but shall conlain fo clher fllers, '

D628 Tenslls Praperies of Plastos, Test for

D780 Flexurst Propertise of Plastlc and Elacitical
Insulating Maburials, Test for

?ﬁ Compressive Properiies of Riglc Plastics, Teat
or

%112 Sheer Strength of Plastics far Punch Too, Tast
=

L8868  Coefficieni of Linear Thermal B i
Plastics, Test far =eneniol
0-3028 Impact Resistonca of Fat, Rigid Plastic
Specimens by means of Tup (Faling Weight), Test for

SEECIFIED STANDARDS
IBL-1 FRF Temiflc Sign Pansl Flatness Test (per
appendix A)



GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

aving Materials - Signs

Alﬁévd/&,

P*

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.

BID SHEET

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein.

All prices SHALL include freight.

TRAFFIC SIGNS
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
12X18 WHITE ON BLUE e By ol 133
12X36 BLACK ON YELLOW i g
18X18 BLACK ON YELLOW 1649
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW [T
18X24 RED ON WHITE A
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE 9LL
18X24 GREEN ON WHITE 14 e
18X6 WHITE ON RED YN
30" CIR BLACK ON YELLOW )5
30" 7RI RED ON WHITE 12 oy
24%30 BLACK ON WHITE 24473
24X8 FLORESGENT YELLOW GREEN 1064
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 30154
30X30 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN DIAMOND OIS
30X30 RED ON WHITE Q.5
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW 4054
30X36 BLACK ON WHITE 2005
36X18 BLACK ON YELLOW 2199
60X30 BLACK ON WHITE iy
6X30 BLACK ON WHITE el
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE .59
24X12 BLACK ON ORANGE a7
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE an gy
36X18 BLACK ON ORANGE 2,00
30X24 BLACK ON ORANGE YUK
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE [ Ap 44
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE FACE ONLY [ cad
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY | <.
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE FACE ONLY | 11 3¢
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY | 12.3%
30X30 RED ON WHITE FACE ONLY | 1730
STREET SIGNS FACE ONLY [ 410 SF
SUPER EN1 INEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GnAéE INTENSITY
18x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED | (2232 Y
24x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED | (643 ™
30x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED [ 20,55
36x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED | 2464
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS '
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 \ fJo ﬁlr/
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS \
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 ‘
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS \ \
30x9 GREEN REINFORGED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS \ J
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 :
{
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS \
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORGED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIG .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORGCED PLASTIC .090 L
MISC. SIGNS RV




GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Siﬁn.\;

SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE OLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
Quirbas 5.5" Madc SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs 3 I
== SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9
Quobs 6.5 Wd e Signs 330
12 GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# 14,20,
10’ GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# 1£.00
8 GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# 1%, 80,
8' Quepay 14 eft SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %" .97
10° Oup bty 14 G SQUARE POST 1 34" X1 34" 5947,
12’ Duchidy G0 SQUARE POST 134" X1 %" 10 QY
3 Buakidy 126 ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2" 950
6" WHITE untmb Dlcs o] 25 | SERIES B UPPERCASE 1 R0
6" WHITE "y SERIES B LOWERCASE 1RO
3" WHITE [ SERIES B UPPERCASE ® 30
3" WHITE | SERIES B LOWERCASE %.30
2" WHITE | 2" SERIES C LETTERS .40
4" WHITE 4" SERIES C LETTERS 550
6" BLAGK 6" SERIES C LETTERS .o
2" BLACK 2" NUMBERS SERIES C 430
4" BLACK | 4" NUMBERS SERIES C Aln
6" BLACK 3 6" NUMBERS SERIES C C
108" PLASTIC Quekna Sngt Gded BARRICADE PLANKS qg %{’)
42" PLASTIC ! BARRICADE A FRAMES 1857,
28" NO COLLARS CONES HYe
28" WITH COLLARS CONES 1<En
STOP SLOW PADDLE £A6
TRI-POD STANDS 1000
Prices for both:
Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity
Specs See:
Department Of Transportation State of
Georgia Standard Specifications for
Construction of Roads and Bridges
Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1
Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec
* Attached
Name of Bidder: ,
hile DATE__(02/2£/24)L
Company:

L{gr‘l He »’;r:'ltmfm LA L’Jf ( 'él/f‘-f {Le

Lead Time:

20-45 Days AR



GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

4-15/7 +/e_

Pavinﬁ Materials - Sii!ns

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.

BID SHEET

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein.

All prices below shall NOT include freight.

5

TRAFFIC SIGNS
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
12X18 WHITE ON BLUE Mo 0. M|
12X36 BLACK ON YELLOW [ 13,74
18X18 BLACK ON YELLOW | 1031
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW ! 1374
18X24 RED ON WHITE 134
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE 1304
18X24 GREEN ON WHITE 1734
18X6 WHITE ON RED | 244
30" CIR BLACK ON YELLOW | Q86
30" TRI RED ON WHITE [ 14,95
24X30 BLACK ON WHITE 2.0
24%8 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN 1aan
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 260
30X30 FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN DIAMOND U7
30X30 RED ON WHITE T
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW a0 £
30X36 BLACK ON WHITE Ay e
36X18 BLACK ON YELLOW | 20,67
60X30 BLACK ON WHITE £, 24
6X30 BLACK ON WHITE )
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE YY)
24X12 BLACK ON ORANGE 91c
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 2 %89
36X18 BLACK ON ORANGE 10.C1
30X24 BLACK ON ORANGE 2797,
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE 28l
18X24 BLACK ON WHITE FACE ONLY w52
18X24 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY AE)
30X30 BLACK ON ORANGE FACE ONLY 212
30X30 BLACK ON YELLOW FACE ONLY (212
30X30 RED ON WHITE FACE ONLY 1112
STREET SIGNS FACE ONLY T
SUPER ENGINEER HIGH
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION GRADE INTENSITY
18x9 GREEN BLANK STHEET SIGNS EXTRUDED 10
24x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED 1&a]
30x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED 1940
36x9 GREEN BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED 134d)
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 fl Lbé(/
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050 \
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .050
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
18x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .080
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
24x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS
30x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .080
BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS U ,0/
36x9 GREEN REINFORCED PLASTIC .090 o B
MISC. SIGNS ] S20Sk
SIZE COLOR DESCRIPTION SUPER ENGINEER HIGH



GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID

Pavini’i Materials - Siﬁns

GRADE SITY
O dpdns 5.5" e SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs 3100
N 2 i SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9" R
Quibng 55" wid e Signs 3i0

12' GREEN U CHANNEL POST 24# [T
10’ GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# oy
8' GREEN U CHANNEL POST 2# ILAD
g (Qaekny (HCH SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %" 15,972
10 Oty 14ES SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %" 1.9
12’ Duedan  1HES SQUARE POST 1 %" X1 %" 14.9¢
3 Quataty 1ALD ANCHOR 3" X 2" X 2" a9L
6" WHITE  (Yupbta Dka) «f 25) SERIES B UPPERCASE Y
6" WHITE i T SERIES B LOWERCASE 11
3" WHITE | SERIES B UPPERCASE oAb
3" WHITE SERIES B LOWERCASE B0
2" WHITE 2" SERIES C LETTERS 20
4" WHITE 4" SERIES C LETTERS £y
6" BLACK | 6" SERIES C LETTERS £ dn
2" BLACK [ 2" NUMBERS SERIES C 420
4" BLACK | 4" NUMBERS SERIES C H,q4
6" BLACK ~V 6" NUMBERS SERIES C 0y
10'8 " PLASTIC Quobna Siale e BARRICADE PLANKS 12 &7y
42" PLASTIC ) BARRICADE A FRAMES R
28" NO COLLARS CONES 1L20
28" WITH COLLARS CONES 14490

STOP SLOW PADDLE AR

TRI-POD STANDS 050

Prices for both:

Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity

Specs See:

Department Of Transportation State of

Georgia Standard Specifications for

Construction of Roads and Bridges

Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1

Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec

* Attached
Name of Bidder:

Dowrd A_Lightle

DATE__02/26/201(

Company:

Uyw-#,’p L';n/t.«fz"/x:\:’j Qf ‘("!""% LLe

Lead Time:

30-9S [hys BRL



GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

INVITATION TO BID

Pavinﬁ Materials - Sii’ns

List all deviations to the bid specifications on this page.

Equal or Greater than these §pecs

SCOPE

This roscificalion sovers general laminats propaities, mechanical propedies, physizal propedias, ard applicable documents

for b mwii, -

+ Fibsrglags Reinforced Plastics (FRP) traffic sontrol sign panels. Thass panels shall be avallable in 048,

.080, 090, 086, and ,135. Pana| thickness of .C8% and .136 are available In whits, yeiiuw, green, red, biue, black, brown

and vory

PHYSICAL PROPERTIES

THICKNESS - Panels shall be (045 .080, 090, .085 or
A28 inches thick with m tolorance of +/4.005 inches.

COoNT * The panel shall hisve & mintmum
21% ylats content. Tha nigh panel glass shall ke read
uslng a 80 Clonamatar and have the fallaving values;
Servick Side - 53% Refleciive,
Backsitle . 65% Reflectiva

SIZE - (angth and width) Punal lemnse on nominal
langth and width specified by Ihe putchaser shail be +/-
1/3 inch for dimenslans of 12 jeet or less when measured
Inh accordeance with ASTM DAR41-80_

SQUARENESS - Paneis shall ba risnufacturad with |
smoath surfacas on both tie tap and bottom of the panay,
within 1/8 inch of squareness per 12 feet of langth when
maastired I accordance with ASTM D3841-80,

COLOR & GL.OSS - Pane| shall ba pigmanted to &
visuatly uniform color. Color shall ba visually unifarm with
the plgments compounded Into the resins bafore cure to
make the calor mn integral part of the lamirate. The white
lpn panel color musi meal the fallowing Teshimidus
Values as measured on the FMG-2 color scale on a
;J!;;Beth 1500 Spectrophotormelten X-72,29, Y-73.80, 2-
4.

coenmmgglﬁt.u.&ganm&hm&m -
Panaly ahall have » maimum coetficiant of (Inaar tenm:
axpansion of 1,8 x 10 inchfineh/ F when tosted in

accordance with ABTM D696-79,

ﬂmugﬂﬂwgg - Panels shall pa classified
miltimatly an Grade I (weather reslstanl) panel as

gpocifiod In ASTM D3I841-20 follawing a 2,000 +108 hour
weatheromotor teat.

FLATNESE - Pansls shall have a maximum deflaction of
0.5 [nches when tested in accordancs with TSPy
(Appendix II),

CT RESISTANCE - Panels shull resist the impact of
5 1.18 I6. falllng ball, dropped fram 60 feet In sccordanca
whh ASTM D36841-80.

THERMAL ﬁmﬁ%ﬁgu - Panel strengih and Impact
resislance shal] nol be nppprulnhty nffacted over a

{mmpersinre range of65 F 1o 212 B,
GENERAL LAMINATE PROPERTIES

traffic control slgu panel shall Bave the
raine smoolh surfaces on both sides with n minimum of
L04 protoctive layar of gel coallng, The panal shall be
randomiy orisated, chiopped fiberalass relnforoad,

1, plamarted poly Hre . The panc
tholl be ucrylic modifiad and UV stabilized for outdonor
weathambility, It shall contaln ndditives to retard flamy
but shatl no other filkers,

kel s

The pane! must not have any vialble fiberglass
prominance. The panel must be stabllized througiout
wilth the glass and 8 nan-shrink cesln, which netards
molsture absorplian lo lass than 001 per square (neh

The' prnel shell ba stablilzed to pravent
release of migrating conslituents over thme. (.a, salvents,
manomers, atc.) and shafl conain no residual releass
agents on the sufece of the laminate that will interfere
any subsequent banding operations,

The panél shall not contain visible racks,
pinholes, foreign Inclusions, or surfacy wiinkles that
would affect implied poformancs, niter the specific
dimenuions of the panel, o otherwide atfect itz
serviceability.

MECHANICAL PROPERTIES

Al mechanics! properfias are stated oo typical averegas
and many vary + 10% onany Individual tesl sverage
The aveimges reprosen| proparties maantired bolh n the
line diraction of ihe panet and &t 80 dogrees to lhat ling,
The mechanieal propertias are tosted in sccurdance with
the appropriale ASTM tests refetenced,

&fb)’”ué’

Avg Min. Req ASTM Test
14,500 psi | D83a
1,000 3 16535
3 D-ran
1,400,000 pet DT
Comprassion Strength 30,000 psi 1>-885
Compratsive Moduius 400,000 pai > Ges
Punch Shagr Strepalh 2000 pa L7z
Face impact Resistance | 1.11bs permiof | D-aozs
thitkness
APPLICARLE DOCUMENTS
ASTM STANDARDS

P8B4l Glass Fiber Reinforced Polyester Panas,
Specifications for

D-638  Tensile Prepariien of Flastics, Tst for

D-780  Flewural Propeites of Plastle and Elecurical
Insulating Materials, Tesl for

f Compressiva Prapariles of Rigld Plastics, Tast
of

r&ﬂ; Shear Strength of Plastics Yor Punch Teol, Test
or

D696 Cosfficient of Linear Thermal Expansion af
Pinstics, Test far

m lmg:a Rasiatanca of Flat, Rigid Plastic
Specimens by means of Tup (Falling Welght), Test far

SPECIFIED STANDARDS
ISP -1 FRP Trfiic Sign Panel Flainess Test (per
appendix A)



