

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs**

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.
The bid prices include shipping costs.

BID SHEET

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein. All prices SHALL include freight.

TRAFFIC SIGNS			SUPER ENGINEER	
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
12X18	WHITE ON BLUE		NO BID	8.82
12X36	BLACK ON YELLOW			14.51
18X18	BLACK ON YELLOW			11.62
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW			14.51
18X24	RED ON WHITE			15.21
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE			14.51
18X24	GREEN ON WHITE			15.21
18X6	WHITE ON RED			5.16
30" CIR	BLACK ON YELLOW			29.42
30" TRI	RED ON WHITE			16.45
24X30	BLACK ON WHITE			24.10
24X8	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN			13.38
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			29.42
30X30	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN	DIAMOND		54.86
30X30	RED ON WHITE			29.42
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW			29.42
30X36	BLACK ON WHITE			35.31
36X18	BLACK ON YELLOW			21.24
60X30	BLACK ON WHITE			58.45
6X30	BLACK ON WHITE			9.51
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			29.42
24X12	BLACK ON ORANGE			10.49
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			29.42
36X18	BLACK ON ORANGE			21.24
30X24	BLACK ON ORANGE			24.10
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			29.42
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE	FACE ONLY		10.54
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY		10.54
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE	FACE ONLY		17.08
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY		17.08
30X30	RED ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	17.08	
STREET SIGNS		FACE ONLY		
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER	HIGH INTENSITY
			GRADE	
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	NO BID	12.25
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		15.58
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		19.48
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		23.26
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		NO BID
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		NO BID
Name of Bidder: Heidi McGee		Date: 05.09.19		
Company: Custom Products Corporation				

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs**

30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	↓	↓
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090		
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090		
MISC. SIGNS				
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
		SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs	NO BID	10.00
		SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9" Signs		10.00
12'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	↓	20.12
10'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#		25.11
8'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#		20.09
8'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"		24.32
10'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"		30.64
12'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"		36.96
3"		ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2"		14.15
6"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE		28.15
6"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE		30.86
3"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE		8.12
3"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE		28.33
2"	WHITE	2" SERIES C LETTERS ^{uppercase}		5.50
4"	WHITE	4" SERIES C LETTERS		12.74
6"	BLACK	6" SERIES C LETTERS		16.47
2"	BLACK	2" NUMBERS SERIES C		4.00
4"	BLACK	4" NUMBERS SERIES C	7.00	
6"	BLACK	6" NUMBERS SERIES C	16.47	
10' 8"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE PLANKS ^{DIF HP 1" thick per board}	105.00	
42"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE A FRAMES ^{Drive per leg}	26.00	
28"	NO COLLARS	CONES	14.50	
28"	WITH COLLARS	CONES	16.33	
		STOP SLOW PADDLE	45.00	
		TRI-POD STANDS	53.25	
Prices for both:				
Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity				
Specs See:				
Department Of Transportation State of Georgia Standard Specifications for Construction of Roads and Bridges				
Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1				
Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec Attached				

Name of Bidder: Heidi McGee DATE 05.09.19

Company: Custom Products Corporation

Lead Time: ships in 5-10 Businessday #if out of stock at time of order can take up to 21 weeks

GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs

List all deviations to the bid specifications on this page.

- Minimum order for free freight \$3,000. Orders under \$3,000 the county will pay freight
- Alloy - See attached Deviations to Specifications
- 18x24 Faces min order (6) identical
- 30" Faces min order (5) identical
- Cones do not include stencil. Stencil fee for application & setup will apply if needed.
- Stop Slow 18" O80 HIP w/ 72" wood handle
- Tripod - GTA not approved on Federal or State Roads.
NCHRP 350 are available
call for quote.



Bid: Paving and Related Materials and Services May 2019-May 2020

Deviations to Specifications/Terms:

CPC will be implementing the enclosed "EXCEPTION" to the agency bid terms due to the Global Aluminum Crisis. The enclosed must be accepted by the agency for bid pricing to be valid.

Since the Trump Tariffs, the sign manufacturing industry has been in upheaval. Price increases in the roadway safety industry in 2018 have gone far beyond just aluminum and reflective sheeting. It has impacted steel, plastic, rubber, and even pavement marking materials. In addition to higher material costs, there have been increased transportation costs. We understand that this situation could not have been predicted when budgets were being set and 2018 job bidding was taking place. CPC was hopeful that some of the tariffs would be mitigated and chaos reduced, but this has not happened. The situation is further complicated as several leaders of the industry predict a severe shortage of aluminum for the year 2019. Supply issues are increasing and aluminum prices are at all-time highs. Due to the state of the industry and the prediction of severe aluminum shortages for 2019, CPC will ship the alloy that we have at our disposal should these severe shortages come to pass. **The alloy will be either 3105 or 5052, or most likely a combination of the two.** The shortages could be severe enough that significant delays in shipments of important safety signs or end of year budget closeouts could be affected. The agency will get the alloy that is available at the time of order.

On a similar note this is a good time for all agencies to consider updating bid specifications regarding the alloy of aluminum. Instead of limiting your sources and spending more on a 5052 virgin alloy that is not environmentally friendly, please consider switching to the recycled 3105 alloy to save money and improve the environment.

Regarding transportation, our freight carriers deliver to your dock only, drivers do not unload. Freight allowance on bid covers freight to delivery locations classed 'Commercial' and having a dock and/or forklift. *If there is no dock or forklift then additional charges will apply.* Additional Freight Accessorials unique to your delivery location or requested by consignee at time of delivery will be billed to customer's account.

CPC is built on serving our customers outstanding quality, competitive prices, speedy delivery, and personal service. With this, we are fortunate to have so many of you who have come to depend on CPC, and have been with us for many years! Thank you for your business. As a leading manufacturer in our industry, we recognize the front of your signs are more important than the aluminum alloy. Please keep this in mind when considering your CPC proposal. As always, you can rest assured that your signs will continue to meet all MUTCD requirements and standards. We don't claim to be the cheapest or the fastest; we do care however, about you, our customer and about our industry and safety. We will continue to strive to use best business practices that are mutually beneficial.

Minimum order for FREE FREIGHT is \$1500.00. Orders under \$3000 will ship Origin and the County will be responsible for the freight charge.

Sincerely,

Heidi McGee, Governmental Bid Manager

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATION

Post Office Box 54091/Jackson, Mississippi 39288/601-932-5854/800-367-1492/Fax 601-932-7178

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs**

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.
The bid prices include shipping costs.

BID SHEET

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein. All prices SHALL include freight.

TRAFFIC SIGNS				
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
12X18	WHITE ON BLUE		6.23	6.83
12X36	BLACK ON YELLOW		12.45	13.65
18X18	BLACK ON YELLOW		9.34	10.24
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW		12.45	13.65
18X24	RED ON WHITE		12.45	13.65
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE		12.45	13.65
18X24	GREEN ON WHITE		12.45	13.65
18X6	WHITE ON RED		3.11	3.41
30" CIR	BLACK ON YELLOW		25.94	28.44
30" TRI	RED ON WHITE		15.56	17.06
24X30	BLACK ON WHITE		20.75	22.75
24X8	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN		7.63	7.63
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		25.94	28.44
30X30	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN	DIAMOND	35.75	35.75
30X30	RED ON WHITE		25.94	28.44
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW		25.94	28.44
30X36	BLACK ON WHITE		31.13	34.13
36X18	BLACK ON YELLOW		18.68	20.48
60X30	BLACK ON WHITE		51.88	56.88
6X30	BLACK ON WHITE		5.19	5.69
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		25.94	28.44
24X12	BLACK ON ORANGE		8.30	8.10
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		25.94	28.44
36X18	BLACK ON ORANGE		18.68	20.48
30X24	BLACK ON ORANGE		20.75	22.75
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		25.94	28.44
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	3.03	4.14
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY	3.03	4.14
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE	FACE ONLY	6.31	8.63
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY	6.31	8.63
30X30	RED ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	6.31	8.63
STREET SIGNS				
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	14.54	15.10
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	19.47	20.22
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	24.34	25.28
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	29.21	30.33
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	no B.O	no B.O
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	no B.O	no B.O
Name of Bidder:		Date		
Robbie Jenks		5/17/2018		
Company Osburn Associates Inc				

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs**

30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	no B.d	no B.d
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090		
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090		
MISC. SIGNS				
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
		SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs ^{5/2}	4.25	
		SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9" Signs ^{5/2}	4.25	
12'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	no B.d	
10'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	no B.d	
8'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	no B.d	
8'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"	no B.d	
10'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"	no B.d	
12'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"	no B.d	
3'		ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2"	no B.d	
6"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE	13.99	15.41
6"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE	13.99	15.41
3"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE	13.25	14.72
3"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE	13.25	14.72
2"	WHITE	2" SERIES C LETTERS	12.57	12.78
4"	WHITE	4" SERIES C LETTERS	13.29	14.35
6"	BLACK	6" SERIES C LETTERS	14.39	16.80
2"	BLACK	2" NUMBERS SERIES C	12.57	12.78
4"	BLACK	4" NUMBERS SERIES C	13.29	14.35
6"	BLACK	6" NUMBERS SERIES C	14.39	16.80
10' 8"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE PLANKS	no B.d	no B.d
42"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE A FRAMES	no B.d	no B.d
28"	NO COLLARS	CONES	no B.d	no B.d
28"	WITH COLLARS	CONES	no B.d	no B.d
		STOP SLOW PADDLE	no B.d	no B.d
		TRI-POD STANDS	no B.d	no B.d
Prices for both:				
		Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity		
Specs See:				
		Department Of Transportation State of Georgia Standard Specifications for Construction of Roads and Bridges		
		Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1		
	*	Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec Attached		

Name of Bidder: Robbie Jenks DATE 5/17/2010

Company: Osburn Associates Inc

Lead Time: 30 Days

GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs

List all deviations to the bid specifications on this page.

Osburn

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs**

We may split the bid. You may bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.
The bid prices include shipping costs.

BID SHEET

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein. All prices SHALL include freight.

TRAFFIC SIGNS				
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
12X18	WHITE ON BLUE		7.43	7.59
12X36	BLACK ON YELLOW		14.16	14.51
18X18	BLACK ON YELLOW		11.12	11.36
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW		14.16	14.51
18X24	RED ON WHITE		14.16	14.51
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE		14.16	14.51
18X24	GREEN ON WHITE		14.16	14.51
18X6	WHITE ON RED		3.93	3.99
30" CIR	BLACK ON YELLOW		28.04	28.85
30" TRI	RED ON WHITE		14.98	15.34
24X30	BLACK ON WHITE		23.59	24.17
24X8	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN		9.06	9.06
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		29.46	30.19
30X30	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN	DIAMOND	40.46	40.46
30X30	RED ON WHITE		29.46	30.19
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW		29.46	30.19
30X36	BLACK ON WHITE		35.37	36.24
36X18	BLACK ON YELLOW		17.55	19.22
60X30	BLACK ON WHITE		58.96	60.42
6X30	BLACK ON WHITE		5.68	6.13
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		29.46	30.19
24X12	BLACK ON ORANGE		9.93	10.14
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		29.46	30.19
36X18	BLACK ON ORANGE		17.55	19.22
30X24	BLACK ON ORANGE		23.59	24.17
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		29.46	30.19
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	4.84	5.17
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY	4.84	5.17
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE	FACE ONLY	10.08	11.89
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY	10.08	11.89
30X30	RED ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	10.08	11.89
STREET SIGNS				
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	10.91	10.55
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	14.50	14.02
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	18.14	17.54
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	21.74	21.02
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		
Name of Bidder: David B. Beviacqua				
Date 5/17/2019				
Company Vulcan Inc.. dba Vulcan Signs				

GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs

30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090	NO BID	NO BID
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090	NO BID	NO BID
MISC. SIGNS				
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
		SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs	3.35	NO BID
		SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9" Signs	3.35	NO BID
12'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	20.89	NO BID
10'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	17.41	NO BID
8'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	13.93	NO BID
8'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"	21.83	NO BID
10'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"	27.28	NO BID
12'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X 1 3/4"	32.74	NO BID
3'		ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2"	10.11	NO BID
6"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE	NO BID	12.50
6"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE	NO BID	12.50
3"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE	NO BID	6.50
3"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE	NO BID	6.50
2"	WHITE	2" SERIES C LETTERS	NO BID	4.50
4"	WHITE	4" SERIES C LETTERS	NO BID	7.50
6"	BLACK	6" SERIES C LETTERS	NO BID	9.50
2"	BLACK	2" NUMBERS SERIES C	NO BID	4.50
4"	BLACK	4" NUMBERS SERIES C	NO BID	7.50
6"	BLACK	6" NUMBERS SERIES C	NO BID	9.50
10' 8"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE PLANKS	NO BID	79.93
42"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE A FRAMES	NO BID	58.89
28"	NO COLLARS	CONES	NO BID	11.55
28"	WITH COLLARS	CONES	NO BID	16.66
		STOP SLOW PADDLE	NO BID	28.95
		TRI-POD STANDS	NO BID	49.50
Prices for both:				
		Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity		
Specs See:				
		Department Of Transportation State of Georgia Standard Specifications for Construction of Roads and Bridges		
		Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1		
	*	Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec Attached		

Name of Bidder: David B. Beviacqua DATE 5/17/2019

Company: Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs

Lead Time: 30-45 Days ARO

GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
INVITATION TO BID
Paving Materials - Signs

List all deviations to the bid specifications on this page.

Vulcan