

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS  
INVITATION TO BID  
Paving Materials - Signs**

We April split the bid. You April bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.  
**The bid prices include shipping costs.**

**BID SHEET**

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein. All prices SHALL include freight.

TRAFFIC SIGNS				
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
12X18	WHITE ON BLUE		No Bid	7.47
12X36	BLACK ON YELLOW			14.94
18X18	BLACK ON YELLOW			11.21
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW			14.94
18X24	RED ON WHITE			14.94
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE			14.94
18X24	GREEN ON WHITE			14.94
18X6	WHITE ON RED			3.90
30" CIR	BLACK ON YELLOW			31.13
30" TRI	RED ON WHITE			19.88
24X30	BLACK ON WHITE			24.90
24X8	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN			7.89
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			31.13
30X30	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN	DIAMOND		26.75
30X30	RED ON WHITE			31.13
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW			31.13
30X36	BLACK ON WHITE			27.35
36X18	BLACK ON YELLOW			22.41
60X30	BLACK ON WHITE			62.25
6X30	BLACK ON WHITE			6.23
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			31.13
24X12	BLACK ON ORANGE			9.96
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			31.13
36X18	BLACK ON ORANGE			22.41
30X24	BLACK ON ORANGE			24.90
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			31.13
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE	FACE ONLY		5.70
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY		5.70
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE	FACE ONLY		11.88
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY		11.88
30X30	RED ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	11.88	
	<b>STREET SIGNS</b>	FACE ONLY		
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	No Bid	15.08
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		20.10
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		25.13
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		30.15
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		No Bid
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		No Bid
Name of Bidder:				
David R. Lightle		Date		
Company Lightle Enterprises of Ohio LLC				

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS  
INVITATION TO BID  
Paving Materials - Signs**

30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	Not bid	Not bid
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	Not bid	Not bid
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090		
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090		
<b>MISC. SIGNS</b>				
<b>SIZE</b>	<b>COLOR</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>SUPER ENGINEER GRADE</b>	<b>HIGH INTENSITY</b>
		SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs <i>9.5'</i>		3.20
		SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9" Signs <i>9.5'</i>		3.20
12'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#		2.120
10'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#		1.756
8'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#		14.00
8'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X1 3/4"		24.00
10'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X1 3/4"		30.00
12'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X1 3/4"		36.00
3'		ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2"		13.50
6"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE		12.90
6"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE		12.90
3"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE		7.70
3"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE		7.70
2"	WHITE	2" SERIES C LETTERS		6.20
4"	WHITE	4" SERIES C LETTERS		7.90
6"	BLACK	6" SERIES C LETTERS		12.80
2"	BLACK	2" NUMBERS SERIES C		6.20
4"	BLACK	4" NUMBERS SERIES C		7.90
6"	BLACK	6" NUMBERS SERIES C		12.80
10' 8"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE PLANKS		47.70
42"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE A FRAMES		14.60
28"	NO COLLARS	CONES		14.80
28"	WITH COLLARS	CONES		17.90
		STOP SLOW PADDLE		36.50
		TRI-POD STANDS		86.50
<b>Prices for both:</b>				
Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity				
<b>Specs See:</b>				
Department Of Transportation State of Georgia Standard Specifications for Construction of Roads and Bridges				
Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1				
<b>Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec Attached</b>				
	*			3205R

Name of Bidder: David R. Lightle  
Lightle Enterprises of Ohio LLC DATE 03/30/2020

Company: Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC

Lead Time: 30-60 Days ARO

## GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS INVITATION TO BID Paving Materials - Signs

We April split the bid. You April bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.  
**The bid prices include shipping costs.**

### BID SHEET

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein. All prices SHALL include freight.

	<b>TRAFFIC SIGNS</b>			
<b>SIZE</b>	<b>COLOR</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>SUPER ENGINEER GRADE</b>	<b>HIGH INTENSITY</b>
12X18	WHITE ON BLUE		4.86	5.32
12X36	BLACK ON YELLOW		10.53	10.95
18X18	BLACK ON YELLOW		8.31	9.12
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW		10.53	10.95
18X24	RED ON WHITE		10.53	10.95
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE		10.53	10.95
18X24	GREEN ON WHITE		10.53	10.95
18X6	WHITE ON RED		3.18	3.49
30" CIR	BLACK ON YELLOW		22.13	23.55
30" TRI	RED ON WHITE		11.40	12.54
24X30	BLACK ON WHITE		17.55	18.25
24X8	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN		NO BID	6.93
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		21.94	22.81
30X30	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN	DIAMOND	NO BID	29.69
30X30	RED ON WHITE		21.94	22.81
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW		21.94	22.81
30X36	BLACK ON WHITE		26.33	27.38
36X18	BLACK ON YELLOW		15.80	16.43
60X30	BLACK ON WHITE		43.88	45.63
6X30	BLACK ON WHITE		4.84	5.12
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		21.94	22.81
24X12	BLACK ON ORANGE		7.71	8.15
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		21.94	22.81
36X18	BLACK ON ORANGE		15.80	16.43
30X24	BLACK ON ORANGE		17.55	18.25
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE		21.94	22.81
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	2.79	3.72
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY	2.79	3.72
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE	FACE ONLY	5.81	7.75
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY	5.81	7.75
30X30	RED ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	5.81	7.75
	<b>STREET SIGNS</b>	FACE ONLY	5.81	7.75
<b>SIZE</b>	<b>COLOR</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>SUPER ENGINEER GRADE</b>	<b>HIGH INTENSITY</b>
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	7.15	10.01
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	9.43	12.48
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	11.79	14.98
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	14.10	17.43
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
Name of Bidder:				
David B. Beviacqua		Date	4/1/2020	
Company Vulcan Inc.				

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS  
INVITATION TO BID  
Paving Materials - Signs**

30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090	NO BID	NO BID
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090	NO BID	NO BID
<b>MISC. SIGNS</b>				
<b>SIZE</b>	<b>COLOR</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>SUPER ENGINEER GRADE</b>	<b>HIGH INTENSITY</b>
		SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs	NO BID	3.15
		SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9" Signs	NO BID	3.15
12'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	NO BID	18.84
10'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	NO BID	15.70
8'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	NO BID	12.56
8'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X1 3/4"	NO BID	16.80
10'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X1 3/4"	NO BID	21.00
12'		SQUARE POST 1 3/4" X1 3/4"	NO BID	25.20
3'		ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2"	NO BID	8.94
6"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE	NO BID	13.50
6"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE	NO BID	13.50
3"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE	NO BID	6.50
3"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE	NO BID	6.50
2"	WHITE	2" SERIES C LETTERS	NO BID	4.55
4"	WHITE	4" SERIES C LETTERS	NO BID	9.35
6"	BLACK	6" SERIES C LETTERS	NO BID	8.50
2"	BLACK	2" NUMBERS SERIES C	NO BID	4.35
4"	BLACK	4" NUMBERS SERIES C	NO BID	10.55
6"	BLACK	6" NUMBERS SERIES C	NO BID	8.50
10' 8 "	PLASTIC	BARRICADE PLANKS	NO BID	79.44
42"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE A FRAMES	NO BID	56.28
28"	NO COLLARS	CONES	NO BID	12.56
28"	WITH COLLARS	CONES	NO BID	17.26
		STOP SLOW PADDLE	NO BID	21.62
		TRI-POD STANDS	NO BID	35.41
<b>Prices for both:</b>				
Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity				
<b>Specs See:</b>				
Department Of Transportation State of Georgia Standard Specifications for				
Construction of Roads and Bridges				
Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1				
<b>Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec Attached</b>				
*				

Name of Bidder: David B. Beviacqua DATE 4/1/2020

Company: Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs

Lead Time: 30-45 Days

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS  
INVITATION TO BID  
Paving Materials - Signs**

We April split the bid. You April bid aluminum and/or fiberglass/reinforced plastic.  
The bid prices include shipping costs.

**BID SHEET**

The undersigned bidder hereby declares that he has carefully examined the information contained herein. All prices SHALL include freight.

SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
12X18	WHITE ON BLUE		NO BID	7.25
12X36	BLACK ON YELLOW			13.78
18X18	BLACK ON YELLOW			10.99
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW			13.78
18X24	RED ON WHITE			13.78
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE			13.78
18X24	GREEN ON WHITE			13.78
18X6	WHITE ON RED			4.69
30" CIR	BLACK ON YELLOW			27.90
30" TRI	RED ON WHITE			15.00
24X30	BLACK ON WHITE			27.89
24X8	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN			9.22
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			27.90
30X30	FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN	DIAMOND		40.93
30X30	RED ON WHITE			27.90
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW			27.90
30X36	BLACK ON WHITE			33.50
36X18	BLACK ON YELLOW			20.66
60X30	BLACK ON WHITE			55.32
6X30	BLACK ON WHITE			3.41
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			27.90
24X12	BLACK ON ORANGE			9.75
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			27.90
36X18	BLACK ON ORANGE			20.66
30X24	BLACK ON ORANGE			22.87
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE			27.90
18X24	BLACK ON WHITE	FACE ONLY		6.88
18X24	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY		6.88
30X30	BLACK ON ORANGE	FACE ONLY		11.47
30X30	BLACK ON YELLOW	FACE ONLY		11.47
30X30	RED ON WHITE	FACE ONLY	11.10	
	<b>STREET SIGNS</b>	FACE ONLY		
SIZE	COLOR	DESCRIPTION	SUPER ENGINEER GRADE	HIGH INTENSITY
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED	NO BID	12.00
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		15.19
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		19.00
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STREET SIGNS EXTRUDED		22.78
18x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		NO BID
24x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		NO BID
Name of Bidder:		Heidi McFee		
Date		03.26.2020		
Company		Custom Products Corporation		

**GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS  
INVITATION TO BID  
Paving Materials - Signs**

30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050	NO BID	NO BID
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .050		
30x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090		
36x9	GREEN	BLANK STEET SIGNS - FIBERGLASS REINFORCED PLASTIC .090		
		<b>MISC. SIGNS</b>		
<b>SIZE</b>	<b>COLOR</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>SUPER ENGINEER GRADE</b>	<b>HIGH INTENSITY</b>
	* 5.5" holder	SIGN BRACKET For 9" Signs	3.98	
	* 5.5" holder	SIGN BRACKET (CAP/CROSS) For 9" Signs	3.98	
12'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	19.04	
10'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	15.86	
8'	GREEN	U CHANNEL POST 2#	12.69	
8'		SQUARE POST 1 1/4" X 1 1/4"	20.80	
10'		SQUARE POST 1 1/4" X 1 1/4"	26.00	
12'		SQUARE POST 1 1/4" X 1 1/4"	31.20	
3'		ANCHOR 3' X 2" X 2"	11.20	
6"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE	NO BID	30.00
6"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE		45.30
3"	WHITE	SERIES B UPPERCASE		10.00
3"	WHITE	SERIES B LOWERCASE		20.00
2"	WHITE	2" SERIES C LETTERS		8.00
4"	WHITE	4" SERIES C LETTERS		18.00
6"	BLACK	6" SERIES C LETTERS		24.00
2"	BLACK	2" NUMBERS SERIES C		7.00
4"	BLACK	4" NUMBERS SERIES C		12.00
6"	BLACK	6" NUMBERS SERIES C		25.00
10' 8"	PLASTIC	BARRICADE PLANKS	NO BID	76.98
42"	PLASTIC * price for 2 legs only	BARRICADE A FRAMES		48.78
28"	NO COLLARS * 715	CONES		11.34
28"	WITH COLLARS * 715	CONES		16.47
		STOP SLOW PADDLE		36.19
		TRI-POD STANDS		45.23
		<b>Prices for both:</b>		
		Super Engineer Grade & High Intensity		
		<b>Specs See:</b>		
		Department Of Transportation State of Georgia Standard Specifications for		
		Construction of Roads and Bridges		
		Aluminum Sign Blanks Type 1		
		<b>Fiberglass Reinforced Plastic - Spec Attached</b>		

Name of Bidder: Heidi McGee DATE 03.26.2020

Company: Custom Products Corporation

Lead Time: ships in 7 business days; orders with die cuts 10-12 business days to ship.

GORDON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS  
INVITATION TO BID  
Paving Materials - Signs

List all deviations to the bid specifications on this page.

- minimum order for free freight is \$3,500.00
- Sign Pricing for MUTCD legends only, (1) color Excludes R3-8 series & Routed shapes (E.G., County Route markers, shields...)  
Price for standard shapes; Circles, squares, rectangles, octagons and triangles.
- Faces - must order at least (6) identical
- Aluminum alloy - will be mix of 5052 & 3105
- Tripod - Quoting GTA
- Stop/Slow - 18" .080 HIP w/ 72" wood handle